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Date
11/05/2024

Amount

$15,950.30

Account Number

1495

Front Image

Sequence Number

5904441880

THIS CHECK IS PRINTED ON CHEMICAL REACTIVE PAPER WHICH CONTAINS A WATERMARK - HOLD UP TO LIGHT TO VIEW "

Serial Number

881006

RACHEL M. SADOFF
CLERK OF THE CIRCUIT COURT 881006
PO. BOX 929 » TITUSVILLE, FLORIDA 32751-0083 No. O
10/28/2024
2 DATE.
Fifteen Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty Dollars and Thirty Cents $15,950.30
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West Virginia Detail Summary

BrevardCountyCl - BrevardCOC - 59-6000524
10/18/2024 04:04 PM EST

Property Code Owner Name Property ID Last Activity Date Amount Shares
CT05 Casto, Arnold Tax Deed 210547 04/05/2022 $12,706.37 0

CTO05 Landis, Marla Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.66 0

CTO05 Shuck, April Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.65 0

CT05 Shuck, Rodney Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.66 0

CT05 Shuck, Timothy Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.65 0

CT05 Shuck, William Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.65 0

CTO05 Skeens, Kelley Tax Deed 220075 10/18/2022 $540.66 0

Total $15,950.30 0
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West Virginia Verification and Checklist
2024 Final Report
UPEnterprise Submission Number: P924b87b3e

Holder Name Brevard County Clerk of Courts Contact Name Jacqualine Cook
Address 400 South Street Address 400 South Street
Titusville, FL 32781 Titusville, FL 32781
Federal ID 59-6000524 Phone 321-637-2002
Incorp. Date  01/01/1855 Incorp. State FL Email jacqualine.cook@brevardclerk.us
Prop.
Code Property Code Description Count Total Amount  Total Shares
CT05 OTHER COURT DEPOSITS 7 $15,950.30 0.0000
GRAND TOTAL 7 $15,950.30 0.0000

I, Jacqualine Cook, certify that | have caused to be prepared and examined the enclosed reports as to property presumed abandoned, that |
am duly authorized to execute this verification by the holder and by law, and that to the best of my information and belief that said reports are
true, correct, and complete.

Additionally, | certify that the holder has exercised due diligence concerning the properties described in this report.

Signature:

Title: Assistant Finance Supervisor Date:

West Virginia Mailing Address

West Virginia State Treasurer's Office
Unclaimed Property Division

PO Box 3328

Charleston, WV 25333
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Submission Confirmation

Your unclaimed property report has been uploaded to the state for processing.

IMPORTANT! You must include the submission number listed below with your check, wire, or ACH
payment to the state. Failure to do so may prevent your payment from being matched to your state
report.

WYV Submission Number: P924b87b3e

Submission Details

Holder Name: Brevard County Clerk of Courts
Holder FEIN: 59-6000524
Holder Address: 400 South Street

Titusville, FL 32781

Contact Name: Jacqualine Cook

Contact Phone: 3216372002

Contact Email: jacqualine.cook@brevardclerk.us
Report Year: 2024

Report Amount: $15,950.30

Reporting Software: UPEnterprise

Submission Date: 10.18.2024 4:04 PM EST



Kathleen Wilkie

From: Jacqualine Cook

Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 8:34 AM

To: Kathleen Wilkie

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL EMAIL]WV Unclaimed Property Report Received

From: HolderReporting@wvunclaimedproperty.gov <HolderReporting@wvunclaimedproperty.gov>
Sent: Saturday, October 19, 2024 12:30 PM

To: Jacqualine Cook <Jacqualine.Cook@brevardclerk.us>

Subject: [EXTERNAL EMAIL]WV Unclaimed Property Report Received

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening attachments,

clicking links or responding to unknown senders.

WYV Unclaimed Property Report Received

Dear Holder:

Your report has been successfully received by the WV State Treasurer’s Office Unclaimed Property Division. If there
are any issues with your report, our holder reporting team will reach out to you.

Name: BREVARD COUNTY CLERK OF COURTS
Report ID: 217403
Remitted Amount: $15,950.30

Electronic payment is available via the WV payment portal at:
wvunclaimedproperty.gov/app/holder/payment/search. For additional payment options, please
visit: https://www.wvunclaimedproperty.gov/docs/WV_Remittance Instructions.pdf.

West Virginia Unclaimed Property
Reporting Team

1-304-558-4876
Eholder_Support@wvsto.gov

Any replies to this email will be automatically sent to eholder_support@wysto.gov at the West Virginia State Treasurer’s Office. The HolderReporting@wvunclaimedproperty.gov address
is for outbound messages only.
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