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Alabama Detail Summary
BrevardCountyCl - BrevardCOC - 59-6000524

10/18/2024 04:04 PM EST

Property Code Owner Name Property ID Last Activity Date Amount Shares

CT05 Barnes, Billy Tax Deed 220006 08/09/2022 $3,093.33 0

CT05 Brown, Leman Tax Deed 210773 03/14/2022 $3,546.20 0

CT05 Oxford Finance Companies Inc
The, Tax Deed 220009 08/09/2022 $2,990.69 0

CT05 Priola, Geneva Tax Deed 220073 10/04/2022 $1,680.18 0

CT05 Priola, Stephen Tax Deed 220073 10/04/2022 $1,680.17 0

Total $12,990.57 0
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Alabama Verification and Checklist
2024 Final Report

UPEnterprise Submission Number: P760bdb7dd

Holder Name Brevard County Clerk of Courts Contact Name Jacqualine Cook
Address 400 South Street Address 400 South Street

Titusville, FL 32781 Titusville, FL 32781
Federal ID 59-6000524 Phone 321-637-2002
Incorp. Date 01/01/1855 Incorp. State FL Email jacqualine.cook@brevardclerk.us

Prop.
Code Property Code Description Count Total Amount Total Shares

CT05 OTHER COURT DEPOSITS 5 $12,990.57 0.0000

GRAND TOTAL 5 $12,990.57 0.0000

I, Jacqualine Cook, do hereby certify the following: (1) I am duly authorized to execute this report and make the following representations on
behalf of the business listed above, (2) Said business has performed due diligence as required by § 35-12-76 (8d), Code of Alabama 1975. (3)
To the best of my knowledge this report is an accurate and complete account of all property in the business custody which is presumed
abandoned under the Alabama Unclaimed Property Act.

The State of Alabama does not accept paper filing!

Signature:

Title: Assistant Finance Supervisor Date:

Alabama Mailing Address
State of Alabama, Unclaimed Property
ATTN: Business Reporting
PO Box 302520
Montgomery, AL 361302520
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Submission Confirmation
Your unclaimed property report has been uploaded to the state for processing.

IMPORTANT! You must include the submission number listed below with your check, wire, or ACH
payment to the state. Failure to do so may prevent your payment from being matched to your state
report.

AL Submission Number: P760bdb7dd

Submission Details

Holder Name: Brevard County Clerk of Courts

Holder FEIN: 59-6000524

Holder Address: 400 South Street
Titusville, FL 32781

Contact Name: Jacqualine Cook

Contact Phone: 3216372002

Contact Email: jacqualine.cook@brevardclerk.us

Report Year: 2024

Report Amount: $12,990.57

Reporting Software: UPEnterprise

Submission Date: 10.18.2024 4:04 PM EST



From: Jacqualine Cook
To: Kathleen Wilkie
Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL EMAIL]Confirmation of Report # 323424
Date: Tuesday, October 22, 2024 8:44:21 AM

 
 
From: al.reporting@up.treasury.alabama.gov <al.reporting@up.treasury.alabama.gov> 
Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 8:20 PM
To: Jacqualine Cook <Jacqualine.Cook@brevardclerk.us>
Subject: [EXTERNAL EMAIL]Confirmation of Report # 323424
 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when
opening attachments, clicking links or responding to unknown senders.

Office of State Treasurer
Unclaimed Property Division
P.O. Box 302520
Montgomery, AL 36130-2520

Confirmation of Report # 323424

Thank you for submitting your report for BREVARD COUNTY CLERK OF COURTS in the
amount of $12,990.57. If your report contains aggregate properties, you are required to submit
the details of the aggregate property by
emailing UNCLAIMED@TREASURY.ALABAMA.GOV. Please state this is the Aggregate
and Supplemental Documentation requested which includes owner's name, address, and dollar
amount. You will need this report number: 323424

 
You may now submit payment. If you are submitting payment for multiple reports in one
transaction, please email us the breakdown of those reports
to UNCLAIMED@TREASURY.ALABAMA.GOV.

 
Below are the payment options and instructions:

 
ACH Instructions for Unclaimed Property Account:
RECEIVING BANK: Synovus Bank

mailto:Jacqualine.Cook@brevardclerk.us
mailto:Kathleen.Wilkie@brevardclerk.us
mailto:UNCLAIMED@TREASURY.ALABAMA.GOV
http://UNCLAIMED@tresury.alabama.gov/
k_wilkie
Highlight



ABA ROUTING #: 061100606
ACCOUNT #: 418
ACCOUNT NAME: State of Alabama Office of State Treasurer-Unclaimed Property
ACCOUNT TYPE: Checking ADDENDA RECORD: Standard EDI Remittance File
* Special Instructions: Include Name of Reporting Business and Tax ID #)
 

Wiring Instructions for Unclaimed Property Account:
RECEIVING BANK: Synovus Bank 1600 Broadway Columbus, GA 31902 (877) 803-3762
ABA ROUTING #: 061100606
BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT NAME: State of Alabama Treasurer - Unclaimed Property
BENEFICIARY ACCOUNT #: 418
COMMENT FIELD Include the name of Reporting Business & Tax ID #

Thank you,

Michael Myers
Director Unclaimed Property
State of Alabama, Office of State Treasurer
www.treasury.alabama.gov

http://www.treasury.alabama.gov/
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Kathleen Wilkie

From: Unclaimed Property <unclaimed@treasury.alabama.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 12:25 PM
To: Kathleen Wilkie
Subject: [EXTERNAL EMAIL]RE: Payment for 2024 Unclaimed Report

   

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening attachments, 
clicking links or responding to unknown senders. 

We can accept check.  Please make payment to the State of Alabama‐Unclaimed Property.  Address is 100 N Union St, Ste 
636  Montgomery, AL 36104. 
 
Alabama State Treasury 
Unclaimed Property Team 
888‐844‐8400 
 

From: Kathleen Wilkie <Kathleen.Wilkie@brevardclerk.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 10:59 AM 
To: Unclaimed Property <unclaimed@treasury.alabama.gov> 
Subject: Payment for 2024 Unclaimed Report 
 
Good morning, 
 
I see that ACH is the preferred method of payment. Will the treasury still accept a check payment? If so, please provide 
payable to and postal address information. 
 
Thank You 
Kathleen Wilkie 
Clerk's Finance Department 

 
 

  

  

  

Under Florida law, all correspondence sent to the Clerk’s Office, which is not exempt or confidential pursuant to 
Chapter 119 of the Florida Statutes, is public record. If you do not want the public record contents of your e‐mail 
address to be provided to the public in response to a public records request, please do not send electronic mail to 
this entity. Instead, contact this office by phone or in writing.  
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